
Most common reasons for journal rejections 

Rejection is the norm in academic publishing. Even researchers at the top of their field 
have experienced rejection.  Several peer-reviewed studies have investigated the 
reasons that journals reject papers. Listed below are the most common rejection 

reasons cited in these studies.1-13 

Lack of originality, novelty, or significance 

1.    Results that are not generalizable 

2.    Use of methods that have become obsolete because of new technologies or 
techniques 

3.    Secondary analyses that extend or replicate published findings without adding 

substantial knowledge 

4.    Studies that report already known knowledge but positions the knowledge as novel 
by extending it to a new geography, population, or cultural setting 

5.    Results that are unoriginal, predictable, or trivial 

6.    Results that have no clinical, theoretical, or practical implications 

One of America’s leading newspapers, the New York Times, recognized the truth that 

“journal editors typically prefer to publish groundbreaking new research.”14 Academic 
journals are constantly on the lookout for research that is exciting and fresh. Many 
authors tend to cite the reason that “this has never been studied before” to explain why 

their paper is significant. This is not good enough; the study needs to be placed in a 
broader context. Authors should give specific reasons why the research is important, for 
example, the research could affect a particular medical intervention, it could have a 

bearing on a specific policy discussion, or it could change a conventional theory or 
belief.  

Mismatch with the journal 

1.    Findings that are of interest to a very narrow or specialized audience that the 
journal does not cater to specifically 

2.    Manuscripts that lie outside the stated aims and scope of the journal 

3.    Topics that are not of interest to the journal’s readership 

4.    Manuscripts that do not follow the format specified by the journal (e.g., case report 
submitted to a journal that explicitly states it doesn’t publish case reports) 

Many manuscripts are rejected outright by journals, before they even undergo peer 
review, because the manuscript is not appropriate for the journal’s readership or does 
not fit into the journal’s aims and scope. The remedy for this is simple: spend some 

time in choosing the accurate journals for submitting you paper. You can start by 

http://www.editage.com/insights/how-to-choose-journals-for-submitting-your-paper


creating a list of journals and reviewing your options before deciding which journal to 
submit your manuscript to. 

  

Flaws in study design 

1.    Poorly formulated research question 

2.    Poor conceptualization of the approach to answering the research question 

3.    Choice of a weak or unreliable method 

4.    Choice of an incorrect method or model that is not suitable for the problem to be 
studied 

5.    Inappropriate statistical analysis 

6.    Unreliable or incomplete data 

7.    Inappropriate or suboptimal instrumentation 

8.    Small or inappropriately chosen sample 

Even a well-written paper will not mask flaws in study design. Indeed, this is a 
fundamental problem that must be resolved in the initial stages of the study, while 

conceptualizing the study. The best way to guard against such flaws is to do a 
thorough literature review to determine the best methodologies and practices for your 
own research.  

  

Poor Writing and Organization 

1.    Inadequate description of methods 

2.    Discussion that only repeats the results but does not interpret them 

3.    Insufficient explanation of the rationale for the study 

4.    Insufficient literature review 

5.    Conclusions that do not appear to be supported by the study data 

6.    Failure to place the study in a broad context 

7.    Introduction that does not establish the background of the problem studied 

  



It is very important for authors to present a persuasive and rational argument in their 
papers. You should be able to convince readers that your research is both sound and 

important through your writing.  

  

Inadequate preparation of the manuscript 

1.    Failure to follow the journal’s Instructions for Authors 

2.    Sentences that are not clear and concise 

3.    Title, abstract, and/or cover letter that are not persuasive 

4.    Wordiness and excessive use of jargon 

5.    Large number of careless errors like poor grammar or spelling mistakes 

6.    Poorly designed tables or figures 

  

Non-English-speaking authors often confront an additional problem: peer reviewers do 

not always distinguish between the manuscript content and style of writing. Thus, their 
manuscripts may end up getting negative comments even if the research is of high 
quality.15  

 
However, all the problems in this category are easily fixable, either by asking a native 
English speaking friend or colleague to review the paper or by getting the paper 

professionally edited and formatted.  

  

Rejection reasons not related to manuscript quality 

Low quality of the manuscript is not the only reason for rejections. Some major factors 

that can also affect journal decisions are: 8,11,16,17 

1.   Space constraints 

It is not uncommon for journals to reject high-quality manuscripts, and the primary 

reason for this is lack of space. Journals want to publish on a range of topics that 
represent the entire scope of the journal. Editors of print journals especially have to 

pick and choose which papers to publish, since they can only publish a limited number 
of articles. Open access journals are less constrained by this consideration since space 
is not a big issue for them. 

  

2.   Quality and experience of peer reviewers 



The quality of peer review varies widely according to reviewers’ professional 
experience, educational background, research interests, etc. 

  

3.   Volume of submissions 

For obvious reasons, journals that attract a large number of submissions will also reject 
a large number of manuscripts. For example, Nature receives 10,000 submissions a 

year, making the rejection of even high quality manuscripts inevitable.  

  

4.   Journal’s decision-making policy 

This varies widely among journals. For example, some journals follow a policy of 

rejecting any manuscript that will require major revisions, while some journals will 
complete another round of another peer review if they are unsure of the manuscript 
quality. 

5.   The journal editor is looking for something specific at a particular time 

Sometimes, journal editors may wish to publish a thematic issue of the journal or may 
be interested in a current hot topic, in which case they might tend to accept more 

papers focusing on that particular topic. 

  

6.   The journal receives more than one submission on the same topic 

In such cases, the journal may well choose to publish only one of the manuscripts, 

rejecting the other for no other reason than that they already have a paper on a similar 
topic.  

  

 



  

Conclusion 

There are many reasons that journals reject manuscripts for publication, some due to 

the quality of the research or manuscript, and some due to completely avoidable 
reasons like mismatch with the journal. Further, it is not rare for journals to reject even 
high-quality manuscripts simply because of space constraints or other issues. The 

reasons given above are some of the most common reasons for rejection, but they are 
not the only ones. Other reasons include salami publications, non-conformance to ethics 
policies, and plagiarism. 
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